
Receive your own named IBAN account
in your company name, wire fiat
payments directly to the IBAN account.
Vice-versa, receive your converted crypto
into that bank account for a more private
conversion. This unique feature provides
a seamless bridge between traditional
banking and the world of digital assets,
making it easier for your business to
operate in both spaces efficiently.

Named IBANsDigital Asset Remittance 

By leveraging blockchain technology,
bypass traditional banking
intermediaries and reduce transaction
times from days to minutes. Benefit from
a seamless, fast, and cost-effective
solution for transferring funds globally.
This efficiency not only accelerates the
flow of business operations but also cuts
down on the fees associated with
international money transfers.
Furthermore, the transparency and
security provided by digital asset
transactions ensure that businesses can
track their funds in real-time.

Access deep liquidity pools and execute
large orders without impacting market
price by trading off the public order book.
Get highly competitive quotes for trades
and execute without causing volatility in
the market. Deep liquidity not only
facilitates the execution of large trades at
optimal prices but also ensures that
these transactions can be completed
swiftly.

Deep Liquidity 

Competitive Pricing

Trade with competitive quotes and avoid
price slippage when placing large
volume orders. Competitive pricing
structures are crucial for clients who
operate with high volumes, as even slight
differences in price can significantly
impact the overall transaction cost. By
utilising tight spreads you’ll minimise
unnecessary costs.

Customised Solutions 

Trade via a user-friendly platform or
directly on chat systems with the trading
desk for a more personalised experience.
These tailored trading solutions cater to
the specific needs and preferences of
clients by offering more flexibility. Enjoy a
trading experience that is optimised for
your unique requirements.

Regulated
Cryptocurrency Services 
Benefit from a compliant and regulated
cryptocurrency environment, ensuring
that your funds are safe and secure. In a
landscape that is often scrutinised for its
regulatory challenges, having access to
regulated cryptocurrency services
signifies a commitment to transparency,
security, and reliability.

Offshore Companies

Digital asset remittance for clients in
offshore jurisdictions, regulated crypto
firms that support companies in high-risk
countries. This is particularly beneficial in
regions where the regulatory
environment is uncertain or where
financial services are heavily monitored.
We assist clients from all jurisdictions
such as Europe, Asia, South America,
Africa, and the Middle East. High-risk
countries we serve include Hong Kong,
UAE, Seychelles, Bahamas, Cayman
Islands and many more.

High-Risk Industries

Crypto solutions for clients operating in
high-risk industries such as gambling,
crypto funds, asset managers and more.
This personalised service and privacy
offered by OTC desks are particularly
valuable for these industries, where the
need to move large amounts of capital
quickly and discreetly is often a key
operational requirement.
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